
wbt companyprofile 2023-02.docx 

 

Waalhaven Botlek Terminal B.V. 

Nieuwesluisweg 268, 3197 KV Rotterdam 

Activities 

Waalhaven Botlek Terminal is a terminal managed by 
the Waalhaven Group for barge containers in 
Rotterdam.  

It is strategically situated between Rotterdam City 
terminals and the Maasvlakte terminals and also 
serves as a main transhipment hub for containers to 
and from all Antwerp en Rotterdam container terminals 
and depots. 

Waalhaven Botlek Terminal is a barge oriented 
terminal with all facilities to handle cargo efficiently and 
with required service levels. The terminal is equipped 
with reefer connections and can handle hazardous 
cargo. The BRZO-license permits long stay for these 
containers. 

The terminal is a Customs area ‘Entrepot C'. This 
enables our clients to tranship their containers with 
minimal Customs procedures and documentation. We 
can assist you with almost all Customs formalities 
through the qualified personnel of Waalhaven Douane 
Service B.V.  

We are embedded in the Intermodal Transport 
Concepts of PSA Antwerp and Maasvlakte, and offer 
you services other terminals cannot, or only at higher 
costs. These services include barging, storage of full 
and empty containers, Customs services and 
additional trucking.  

Combined with the repair and cleaning facilities on our 
terminal via UWT, the terminal provides a unique all-in 
service concept in the Port of Rotterdam. 

• Container Terminal 

• Multimodal 

• Fumigation Facility 

• Customs Entrepot "C" 

• VGM weight certificate 

Container fumigation facility  

Conventional and mechanical fumigation of container 

possible on our facility which delivers high quality and 

low cost solution for fumigated containers. 

Opening Hours and Operational Details  

Opening Hours (excluding national holidays) 

 

Monday – Friday 06:00 - 22:00 hrs 

Weekend on request 

Terminal 100,000 sqm 

Reefer power 70 power plugs 

Quay 

Length 300 metres 

Depth alongside quay 6,5 metres 

Crane 2x Gantry 

Lifting capacity 35 tons 

Storage capacity 2,500 TEU full 

 8,000 TEU empty 

Transhipment capacity 

per year 200,000 TEU 

Repair facilities 1.500 sqm shed for indoor 
 repairs, cleaning and  
 PTI facility 

Customs facility Entrepot C 

Security Continuous (video) 
 surveillance by certified 
 security firm, infra-red and 
 electronic fence protection 

 
 

Personal contact 

 

  

 JAN OVERDEVEST 

 Managing Director 

 

e-mail joverdevest@waalhaven-group.nl 

phone +31889440081 

mobile +31653496406 

 

website www.waalhavenbotlekterminal.nl 
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